
Preliminary Bid 

Bid Due Date: June 26, 2020

*  This total does not include all items in this Basket

NO BID

NO BID

202,554.50$ *

11,875.00$    

95,689.00$    

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Bingham and Taylor Corporation

Group C - 1: Transition Couplings < 16" (16)

Group H - 1: Brass Fittings (27)

Group H - 2: Brass Nipples (66)

Group H - 3: Pex (2)

Group D - 2: Gate Valves < 16" (5)

Group D - 3: Gate Valves 16" + (12)

Group E - 1: Tapping Sleeve with MJ Outlet (45)

Group F - 1: Stainless Steel Repair Clamps (18)

Group G - 1: SDR Pipe (7)

Group B - 3: MJ Fittings (129)

Group C - 2: Transition Couplings > 16" (16)

Group D - 1: Tapping Valves (3)

Group A - 2: Catch Basins (10)

Group A - 3: Valve Boxes (11)

Group A - 5: Curb Boxes (5)

Group B - 1: Ductile Iron Pipe (8)

Group B - 2: Mega Lug Kits (12)

Group A - 4: Meter Pits (3)

Project No.: 2020-015-OPS

Group A - 1: Manhole Covers and Risers (14)

Project Name: Water and Sewer Inventory Supplies



NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Group I - 3: B84 - 6" Hydrant (32)

Group I - 4: Kennedy Hydrant (47)

Group I - 5: Mueller Hydrant (4)

Group I - 6: Complete Hydrant (3)

Group I - 1: B50 Hydrant (49)

Group I - 2: B84 - 5.25" Hydrant (26)



NO BID 239,034.70$ NO BID NO BID

NO BID 360,105.50$ NO BID NO BID

NO BID 95,191.50$    * NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID 13,237.00$         NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

309,835.80$ NO BID 310,135.20$       NO BID

140,775.28$ NO BID 139,783.74$       NO BID

260,839.06$ NO BID 258,611.98$       NO BID

918,746.00$ NO BID 1,083,791.30$    NO BID

353,340.00$ NO BID 182,092.97$       NO BID

22,596.00$    24,156.84$    29,862.18$         25,389.48$    

227,172.00$ 242,121.84$ 300,189.60$       255,236.34$ 

516,057.00$ 106,735.48$ * 828,354.60$       579,235.62$ 

249,348.80$ NO BID 385,254.52$       NO BID

89,212.05$    NO BID 86,002.67$         NO BID

26,843.32$    NO BID 26,663.98$         NO BID

442,961.75$ NO BID 471,019.75$       NO BID

32,016.00$    NO BID 28,441.00$         * NO BID

Ferguson WaterworksEJ USA, Inc.Core & Main LP Kennedy Valve



11,660.00$    NO BID 11,000.00$         NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

185,122.84$ NO BID NO BID 224,064.90$ 

NO BID NO BID 87,137.00$         78,108.00$    

423,600.00$ NO BID 689,308.00$       475,581.00$ 



NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

25,570.00$       19,715.00$       NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

307,543.40$     326,604.00$     313,590.80$     

146,087.20$     148,304.46$     153,253.52$     

260,782.98$     273,257.79$     271,749.03$     

1,065,051.84$ 920,177.30$     * 1,099,728.00$ 

270,741.58$     41,947.60$       * 363,237.00$     

28,752.00$       23,222.28$       32,169.48$       

289,758.00$     243,616.62$     302,936.58$     

171,069.00$     * 230,659.08$     * 815,185.00$     

293,415.08$     315,497.92$     245,080.00$     

97,719.76$       103,030.25$     178,869.00$     

26,598.60$       27,584.90$       * 28,504.28$       

484,462.75$     462,846.75$     502,503.75$     

29,501.00$       39,210.00$       * NO BID

LB Water Service, Inc. National Road Utility Supply, Inc. Pipelines, IncKennedy Valve



12,760.00$       NO BID 16,660.00$       

212,644.05$     NO BID NO BID

101,997.50$     NO BID NO BID

100,778.35$     NO BID NO BID

NO BID 183,123.20$     NO BID

* NO BID 31,800.00$       * 116,750.00$     

455,500.00$     423,740.00$     668,200.00$     



NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

317,120.60$ 

153,230.14$ 

NO BID

958,038.94$ 

270,745.02$ 

30,931.38$    

313,416.54$ 

657,881.00$ 

* 366,104.82$ 

121,195.36$ 

NO BID

* 438,151.00$ 

32,139.00$    

Trumbull Industries Pipelines, Inc



NO BID

250,099.04$ 

156,773.71$ 

138,208.44$ 

198,171.04$ 

NO BID

458,460.00$ 


