

Project Name: Small Meters  
 Project Number: 2020-008-CAP  
 Bid Opening: August 13, 2020

	Badger Meter Inc	Ferguson Waterworks	LB Water Service, Inc.	Neptune Technology Group Inc.
Total Cost	\$1,214,974.75	\$25,654.00	\$425,431.00	\$1,061,325.00
Selected #	0	0	15	8
Selected (\$)	\$0	\$0	\$425,431.00	\$1,034,325.00

#	MeterSize	Application	Description	Estimated Quantity	UOM	UnitPrice	ExtendedPrice	UnitPrice	ExtendedPrice	UnitPrice	ExtendedPrice	UnitPrice	ExtendedPrice
<b>1</b>													
#1-1	5/8"	Pit	Positive Displacement	4000	EA	\$73.95	\$295,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$64	\$256,000.00
#1-2	5/8" x 3/4"	Pit	Positive Displacement	6000	EA	\$73.95	\$443,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$64	\$384,000.00
#1-3	3/4"	Pit	Positive Displacement	2000	EA	\$95.95	\$191,900.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$85	\$170,000.00
#1-4	1"	Pit	Positive Displacement	2000	EA	\$125.95	\$251,900.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$112	\$224,000.00
#1-5	5/8"	Non-Pit	Positive Displacement	1	EA	\$73.95	\$73.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$64	\$64
#1-6	5/8" x 3/4"	Non-Pit	Positive Displacement	1	EA	\$73.95	\$73.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$64	\$64
#1-7	3/4"	Non-Pit	Positive Displacement	1	EA	\$95.95	\$95.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$85	\$85
#1-8	1"	Non-Pit	Positive Displacement	1	EA	\$125.95	\$125.95	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$112	\$112
<b>2</b>													
#2-1	3/4"	Pit	Electromagnetic or Ultrasonic	100	EA	\$130.95	\$13,095.00	\$114	\$11,400.00	\$96	\$9,600.00	\$130	\$13,000.00
#2-2	1"	Pit	Electromagnetic or Ultrasonic	100	EA	\$179	\$17,900.00	\$140	\$14,000.00	\$125	\$12,500.00	\$140	\$14,000.00
#2-3	3/4"	Non-Pit	Electromagnetic or Ultrasonic	1	EA	\$130.95	\$130.95	\$114	\$114	\$96	\$96	No Bid	No Bid
#2-4	1"	Non-Pit	Electromagnetic or Ultrasonic	1	EA	\$179	\$179	\$140	\$140	\$125	\$125	No Bid	No Bid
<b>3</b>													
#3-1	N/A	N/A	MXU510M-W-1, Flexnet Migrateable MXU - Non-Pit Version, Wired Single Port	1000	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$106.25	\$106,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
#3-2	N/A	N/A	MXU520M-W-1, Flexnet Migrateable MXU - Pit Version, Wired Single Port	1000	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$112.50	\$112,500.00	No Bid	No Bid
#3-3	N/A	N/A	Tailpiece 5/8", C38-11-2.375-NL 5/8", (5/8 METER) x 1/2" MPT	3000	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.17	\$24,510.00	No Bid	No Bid
#3-4	N/A	N/A	Tailpiece 3/4", C38-23-2.5-NL 3/4" (5/8x3/4 METER) x 3/8" MPT	3000	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$9.30	\$27,900.00	No Bid	No Bid
#3-5	N/A	N/A	Tailpiece 1", C38-44-2.625-NL 1" (1" meter) X 1" MPT	2000	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.35	\$28,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
#3-6	N/A	N/A	Gasket 5/8"GT- 108 MTR CPLG, Leather	7000	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.15	\$1,050.00	No Bid	No Bid
#3-7	N/A	N/A	Gasket 3/4", GT-114 MTR CPLG, Leather GASKET 3/4"	12000	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.15	\$1,800.00	No Bid	No Bid
#3-8	N/A	N/A	Gasket 1", MTR CPLG, GASKET 1" Leather	2000	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.20	\$400.00	No Bid	No Bid
#3-9	N/A	N/A	Nomads complete with Command Links and charging accessories	15	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,000.00	\$75,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
#3-10	N/A	N/A	Nomads including chargers Command Links including	5	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,500.00	\$22,500.00	No Bid	No Bid
#3-11	N/A	N/A	chargers	5	EA	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$500	\$2,500.00	No Bid	No Bid