

Heavy Duty Forklifts				OCTANE FORKLIFTS INC		Technology International, Inc.		Towlift-Pittsburgh	
PWSA Project No. 2020-024-OPS			<b>Total Cost</b>	\$77,204.00		\$86,054.00		\$86,678.10	
Bid Due Date: October 22, 2020 at 2:00 p.m				0		0		0	
				\$0		\$0		\$0	
	Items	Quantity	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
Forklift A - 8,000lb Gasoline Pneumatic Tire Forklift (4)									
#1-1	Forklift A (machine cost)	1	EA	\$42,862.00	\$42,862.00	\$32,744.00	\$32,744.00	\$50,645.60	\$50,645.60
#1-2	Forklift A Maintenance Contract	1	Year	\$0	\$0	No Bid	No Bid	\$500	\$500
#1-3	Forklift A Warranty	3	Year	\$0	\$0	\$0	\$0	\$0	\$0
#1-4	Forklift A Delivery	1	EA	\$0	\$0	\$0	\$0	\$0	\$0
Forklift B - 6,000lb Gasoline Pneumatic Tire Forklift (4)									
#2-1	Forklift B (machine cost)	1	EA	\$34,342.00	\$34,342.00	\$53,310.00	\$53,310.00	\$35,032.50	\$35,032.50
#2-2	Forklift B Maintenance Contract	1	Year	\$0	\$0	No Bid	No Bid	\$500	\$500
#2-3	Forklift B Warranty	3	Year	\$0	\$0	\$0	\$0	\$0	\$0
#2-4	Forklift B Delivery	1	EA	\$0	\$0	\$0	\$0	\$0	\$0