Project Name: Water Treatment Chemicals

Project No.: 2020-022-OPS

Bid Due Date: September 29, 2020

CHEMTRADE CHEMICALS

Carus LLC (f/k/a Carus

Hydrofluosilicic Acid

Tons

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$473.60

$223,539.20

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

**Citiric Acid Liquid 80%- We are not awarding Applied Specialties, Inc. BIOSAFE SYSTEMS Brenntag Northeast LLC US LLC CarbPure Technologies, LLC Corporation) Donau Carbon US LLC Dubois Chemicals, Inc. Ingevity
Unit
of Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Items Measure Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost

No Bid

Hydrofluosilicic Acid - Shipping & Handling/Demurrage

Per Year

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

High Test Calcium Hypochlorite Granular Form Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
High Test Calcium Hypochlorite Granular Form Shipping &
Handling/Demurrage Per Year No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Caustic Soda -50% (bulk)

Gallons

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1.62

$194,220.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

High Test Calcium Hypochlorite Tablet Form Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
High Test Calcium Hypochlorite Tablet Form Shipping &
Handling/Demurrage Per Year No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Caustic Soda -50% (bulk) Shipping & Handling/Demurrage

Per Year

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Soda Ash- Dense

Tons

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$306.50

$873,831.50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$315

$898,065.00

No Bid

Caustic Soda -25% 55 Gallon Drums No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $89.60 $25,803.36 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Caustic Soda -25% Shipping & Handling/Demurrage Per Year No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Potassium Permanganate Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5,620.00 | $252,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Potassium Permanganate Shipping &
Handling/Demurrage Per Year No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Soda Ash-Dense Shipping & Handling/Demurrage

Citric Acid Powder

Per Year

Tons

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1,600.00

No Bid

$38,400.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$75

No Bid

$75

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Citric Acid Powder Shipping & Handling/Demurrage

Citric Acid Ligid 80%-+(totes)

Per Year

275 GallonTFotes

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

No Bid

No-Bid

e Acid Liouid 20% Shiooina g liell

PerYear

Ne-Bid

Ne-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

Ne-Bid

Ne-Bid

No-Bid

Ne-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

Ne-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

No-Bid

Ne-Bid

Liquid Ferric Chloride

Tons

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Liguid Sodium Hypochlorite Gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.80 $379,872.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Liquid Sodium Hypochlorite Shipping &
Handling/Demurrage Per Year No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Powdered Activated Carbon Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,630.00 $489,000.00 No Bid No Bid $1,391.00 |$417,300.00 No Bid No Bid $1,620.00 |S$486,000.00
Powdered Activated Carbon Shipping &
Handling/Demurrage Per Year No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid S0 S0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Liquid Ferric Chloride Shipping & Handling/Demurrage

Per Year

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Lime Slurry

Wet Pounds

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.08

$322,996.05

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Phosphoric Acid (bulk) Gallons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.26 $220,176.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Phosphoric Acid (bulk) Shipping & Handling/Demurrage Per Year No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Phosphoric Acid (totes) 275 Gallon Totes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,352.63 | $301,136.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,815.00 | $232,320.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Phosphoric Acid (totes) Shipping & Handling/Demurrage Per Year No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Lime Slurry Shipping & Handling/Demurrage

Per Year

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Lime with additive Wet Pounds $0.08 $188,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Lime with additive Shipping & Handling/Demurrage Per Year SO SO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Greenclean Pro or Equivalent Tons No Bid No Bid $2,000.00 |$24,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Greenclean Pro or Equivalent Shipping &

Handling/Demurrage Per Year No Bid No Bid SO S0 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Sodium Bisulfite

275 Gallon Totes

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Cationic Polymer (Clarifloc C-4410 or approved equal) Tons No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Cationic Polymer (Clarifloc C-4410 or approved equal)
Shipping & Handling/Demurrage Per Year No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Sodium Bisulfite Shipping & Handling/Demurrage

Per Year

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




JCI JONES CHEMICALS INC Jacobi Carbons, Inc. Kemira Water Solutions PVS Technologies, Inc. Pencco, Inc Personal Phoenix Solutions Polydyne Inc. SAL Chemical TRINTERNATIONAL INC. Univar Soutions USA Inc W.K. Merriman, Inc.
Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost Price Cost

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S452 $213,344.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $364.67 |$172,124.24 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,170.00 | $6,340.00 No Bid No Bid $3,980.00 | $7,960.00 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,379.00 $8,758.00 No Bid No Bid $5,040.00 | $10,080.00 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid
S1.61 $193,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.82 $218,400.00 $1.40 $167,760.00 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,600.00 | $3,600.00 SO SO No Bid No Bid
S77 $22,176.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $93.44 $26,910.72 No Bid No Bid $69.40 $19,986.62 No Bid No Bid $126.50 $36,432.00 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $287.15 |$818,664.65 $349 $994,999.00 $299.96 |$855,185.96 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO $8,500.00 | $8,500.00 SO SO No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,625.00 | $63,000.00 No Bid No Bid $1,658.00 | $39,792.00 No Bid No Bid $1,946.00 | $46,704.00 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid
S0.70 $331,646.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid S0.74 $349,226.43 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid $1,398.00 | $419,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,506.00 |$451,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,000.00 $2,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $675 $1,876,500.00 $541 $1,503,980.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO SO SO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.62 $233,024.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,631.75 [$336,864.00 No Bid No Bid $1,820.50 [$233,024.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.06 $240,176.55
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO S0
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.09 $211,680.00 $0.06 |$151,200.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO SO SO
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $559.60 |$101,287.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$563.75 $11,275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $686.25 $13,725.00 No Bid No Bid $547.25 $10,945.00 No Bid No Bid $964.89 $19,297.80 No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid SO SO No Bid No Bid




	Sheet 1

