
Preliminary Bid 

Bingham & Taylor 
Corporation Core & Main LP EJ USA, Inc. Ferguson Waterworks LB Water Service, Inc.

National Road Utility 
Supply, Inc. Pipelines, Inc. Trumbull Industries

Bid Due Date: June 25, 2021
*  This total does not include all items in this Basket

Group A: Street Repaving Sewer Risers & Lid *$257,323.34 NO BID * $874,905.42 *$117,500.5 *$18,935 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Group B: Ductile Iron Pipe & Fittings (245) NO BID $2,348,824.35 NO BID *$1,710,476.36 *$625,171.1 *$2,289,838.76 *$2,362,591.25 *$317,454.4

Group C1: Ductile Iron Transition Couplings (27) NO BID NO BID NO BID $392,681.37 $378,737.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Group C2: Two-Bolt Transition Couplings (11) NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,088,171.64 $1,086,137.24 $1,066,168.20 NO BID NO BID

Group D: Tapping Valves and Gate Valves (40) NO BID *$3,769,640.28 *$475,676.39 *$2,370,911.73 *$1,218,711.72 *$3,783,643.1 *$2,382,896.49 $4,381,919.00

Group E: Tapping Sleeves (45) NO BID $134,674.78 NO BID $263,275.28 $258,905.34 $162,074.56 NO BID NO BID

Group F: Stainless Steel Repair Clamps (24) NO BID $97,810.54 NO BID $94,520.16 $145,236.43 $147,397.04 NO BID NO BID

Group G: PVC Sewer Pipe (7) NO BID NO BID NO BID $73,579.66 NO BID NO BID $64,618.40 NO BID

Group H: PVC Pipe Fittings (145) NO BID NO BID NO BID $32,533.23 *$30,269.77 NO BID *$26,671.89 NO BID

Group I1: Brass Fittings (122) NO BID *$722,818.25 NO BID *$891,538.6 *$794,022.8 *$788,726.25 NO BID NO BID

Group I2: Pex Tubing (2) NO BID $11,900.00 NO BID $12,020.00 $13,240.00 NO BID $18,140.00 NO BID

Group J: Complete Hydrants (3) NO BID $387,300.50 NO BID $368,766.00 $244,850.00 $380,948.50 NO BID $253,250.00

Project Name: Water and Sewer Inventory Supplies
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