

					Berman Truck Group		TRI STAR MOTORS		WHITMOYER AUTO GROUP	
Project No.: 2021-015-OPS					\$233,892.84		\$666,487.00		\$285,500.00	
Project Name: 2022 Fleet Vehicle Purchases										
*The low bidder, TriStar Motors, for line item #1-1 could not hold pricing so the next lowest bidder, Whitmoyer, was awarded line item one.										
#	Items	Description2	Est Qty	UOM	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1										
#1-1	*Ford F150 Toolbox, tonneau	New Ford F150, 4WD SuperCab, 8' bed	7	Each	No Bid	No Bid	\$29,893.00	\$209,251.00	\$36,050.00	\$252,350.00
#1-2	RAM 3500 with Compressor and Generator	New Ram 3500 Chassis, Regular cab 4X2 143.5" WB and 60" CA	2	Each	No Bid	No Bid	\$105,894.00	\$211,788.00	No Bid	No Bid
#1-3	Ford F550, Regular Cab with Cormach Crane (transfer)	New Ford F550, Regular cab 4X4 19,500 GVW, 84" CA	1	Each	No Bid	No Bid	\$76,344.00	\$76,344.00	\$77,540.00	\$77,540.00
#1-4	Ford F350 with Small Crane	New Ford F350, Regular cab 4X4, 60" CA	1	Each	No Bid	No Bid	\$113,967.00	\$113,967.00	\$114,975.00	\$114,975.00
#1-5	Ford Transit Gate Valve Van	New Ford 2020 T350 148: LOW ROOF 9000 GVRW Sliding RH / LH Doors	1	Each	No Bid	No Bid	\$95,928.00	\$95,928.00	\$98,425.00	\$98,425.00
#1-6	Ford T250 Leak Detection Van	New Ford T250 148: Hi Rf 9000 GVRW Sliding RH Dr	1	Each	No Bid	No Bid	\$56,468.00	\$56,468.00	\$58,350.00	\$58,350.00
2										
#2-1	Freightliner M2-106 Dump Truck	New Freightliner M2-106 Dump Truck	2	Each	\$116,946.42	\$233,892.84	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3										
#3-1	Ford Escape Hybrid AWD	New Ford Escape SE Sport Hybrid AWD	4	Each	No Bid	No Bid	\$27,998.00	\$111,992.00	\$28,300.00	\$113,200.00
#3-2	Chevrolet Bolt EUV	New Chevrolet Bolt EUV LT	1	Each	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$33,150.00	\$33,150.00